Bleacher & Wood Floor Refurbishment at Panzer Gym

£ MONTCLAIR STATE

=
=

UN

=
=

RSITY

L

1 NORMAL AVENUE, MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY 07043

MSU PROJECT # 21C002

PROJECT INFORMATION:

PROJECT NOTES

THIS PROJECT CONSISTS OF THE FOLLOWING SCOPES OF WORK.

1) THE BASE BID WILL INCLUDE BUT NOT BE LIMITED TO:
— WOOD FLOOR RESURFACING & FINISH SEALING

— INSTALLATION OF NCAA-COMPLIANT COURT MARKINGS & TEXT AND/OR GRAPHICS

A

2) THE ALTERNATE # WLL INCLUDE BUT NOT BE LIMITED TO:
REPLACEMENT OF DAMAGED METAL WALL GRILLES, (5)-38"H X 20"W, MATCH TYPE &
PAINT TO MATCH EXISTG WALL (G.C. TO VERIFY DIM'S/SPECS IN FIELD)

3) THE ALTERNATE # 2 TO CONVERT EXIST'G HUSSEY MAXAM TELESCOPIC BLEACHER
SYSTEM TO 1ST ROW POWER OPERATION WILL INCLUDE, BUT NOT BE LIMITED TO:

— DISASSEMBLY OF 1ST ROW AND 2ND ROW IN ENTIRETY — INCLUDING SEATS AND
DECKING

— REMOVAL OF 2ND TIER POWER FRAME DRIVE SYSTEM IN ENTIRETY- INCLUDING MOTOR,
GEAR BOX, TORQUE TUBES, AND WIRING HARNESS.

— INSTALLATION OF STANDARD 2ND TIER MAXAM PLUS FRAMES TO ACCOMMODATE NEW
FIRST ROW POWER OPERATION.

— INSTALLATION OF NEW 1ST TER POWER FRAMES SO THAT BLEACHER OPERATES WITH
1ST ROW POWER.

— REUSE/REINSTALLATION OF EXISTING WIRING HARNESS THROUGHOUT 1ST ROW TO
ACCOMMODATE 1ST ROW POWER OPERATION.

— INSTALLATION OF NEW ADA FLEX ROWS. (LOCATIONS T.B.D. OWNER/ARCH TO REVIEW &
APPROVE)

— REASSEMBLY OF 1ST AND 2ND ROW DECKS ON ALL (3) BLEACHER BANKS.

— REINSTALLATION TO 1ST TER ALL PREVIOUSLY-REMOVED 2ND TIER MOTORS, GEAR
BOXES, TORQUE TUBES, AND WIRING HARNESSES

— STRESSING OF CANTILEVER ARMS TO OPERATING TOLERANCES BY HYDRAULIC MEANS
AS REQUIRED

— STRAIGHTENING OR REPAIR OF TIER CATCHES (ROW LOCKS), GUIDE RODS OR LOWER
TRACKING GUIDES AS NEEDED

— ADJUSTMENT OR REPAIR OF UPPER AND LOWER GUIDE ATTACHMENT POINTS

— ALIGNMENT OF DECK SUPPORTS OR SEAT SUPPORTS DIAPHRAGMS AS REQUIRED

— TIGHTENING OF LOOSE OR REPLACEMENT OF MISSING HARDWARE IN BRACING AS
NEEDED

— INSPECTION OF NYLON ROLLERS TO ASSURE SMOOTH OPERATION.

— ADJUSTMENT OF SECTION CONNECTORS TO ENSURE BOLTS ARE TIGHT AND DECKS ARE
PROPERLY ALIGNED

— CONFIRMATION OF SECURE & UNCOMPROMISED ATTACHMENT POINTS & HARDWARE AT
REAR RISER

— INSPECTION OF DECKS FOR SAFETY ITEMS (IE. SHARP CORNERS, ROUGH EDGES, SPLIT
LUMBER, MISSING HARDWARE, ETC.) & REPAIR THEREOF

— REPAIR/REPLACEMENT OF DECK OUTRIGGERS AS NEEDED

— TIGHTENING/TORQUING /REPLACING MISSING HARDWARE AS NEEDED

— SECURE INTERMEDIATE HALF STEPS TO DECK WHERE NECESSARY

— REPAIR OF TRANSITIONAL STEP HARDWARE AND BRACKETS AS NEEDED

— VERIFICATION / REPLACEMENT OF PROPER LOCATION & OPERATION OF ALL SET
SCREWS OR LOCKING METHODS FOR RAILINGS

— CONFIRMATION AND/OR INSTALLATION OF A SAFE, SECURE, CODE—COMPLIANT
ELECTRICAL INSTALLATION

— INSPECTION OF PROPER OPERATION OF ALL COMPONENTS & COMPLETE INSTALLATION,
INCLUDING: MOTOR AND GEARBOX, BEARINGS, ROLLER CHAIN, MASTER LINKS, DRIVE
WHEELS, DRIVE SHAFTS, WEIGHTS, TORQUE TUBES, SPACER PLATES, TORSION SPRINGS,
MOUNTING BRACKETS, MOTOR ALIGNMENT AND WEIGHT ADJUSTMENTS.

— INSPECTION & LUBRICATION OF SEAT SUPPORTS/DIAPHRAGM, SEAT BOTTOMS, BACKS,
SEAT STANCHIONS AND SEAT LOCK/UNLOCK MECHANISMS

— ALL EQUIPMENT, LABOR & INSTALLATION COSTS FOR THE ABOVE SCOPE, AND

4) THE ALTERNATE #3 WILL INCLUDE BUT NOT BE LIMITED TO:

INSTALLING OF NEW WALL CRASH MATTING, APPROX. 41" L X 6' H. (G.C. TO VERIFY
DIM'S/SPECS IN FIELD) NEW MATTING TO COMPLY WITH NCAA/SPORT REGULATIONS, AND
BE ATTACHED PER MANU. INSTALLATION GUIDE. COLOR TO BE "MSU RED" OR CLOSEST
MATCH AS APPROVED BY OWNER (RAL NUMBER TO BE PROVIDED)

CODES / REGULATION REQTS

—=> EXISTING BUILDING IN CONFORMANCE WITH IBC, THEREFORE....

1. NO CHANGES/ADDITIONS TO EXISTING BUILDING AREAS.

2. SUPERVISED FIRE ALARM & DETECTION SYSTEM TO REMAIN.

3. BUILDING EXITING/MEANS OF EGRESS TO REMAIN.

4. NEW PENETRATIONS/OPENINGS SHALL BE FLASHED/STOPPED/CAULKED TO MAINTAIN
EXISTING BUILDING ENVELOPE.

—=> REVISED BLEACHER INSTALLATION MUST CONFORM TO ALL APPLICABLE REQUIREMENTS
OF CURRENT BUILDING CODES (IE. ANSI 117.1, IBC, OSHA) WITH REGARDS TO
ACCESSIBILITY, EGRESS & SAFETY.

—=> REVISED BLEACHER ELECTRICAL INSTALLATION MUST CONFORM TO ALL APPLICABLE
REQUIREMENTS OF NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE / NFPA 70.

——> COURT MARKINGS ARE TO CONFORM TO MOST RECENT NCAA REQUIREMENTS,
INCLUDING 3—POINT LINE

WALL PADDING CODES:

— ASTM F-2440-11

— HIC (HEAD INJURY CRITERION)
- G—-MAX

— NFPA 286

— NFPA 255 (ASTM E-84)

SCOPE OF WORK:

1. THE WORK COVERED BY THE DRAWINGS AND THE SPECIFICATIONS IS TO INCLUDE THE
FURNISHING OF ALL MATERIALS, LABOR, EQUIPMENT, TOOLS, TAXES, TRANSPORTATION,
UTILITIES, AND INCIDENTALS NECESSARY FOR THE COMPLETE INSTALLATION OF ALL
SYSTEMS AS DESCRIBED IN THE CONTRACT DOCUMENTS AND SPECIFIED HEREIN, UNLESS
OTHERWISE NOTED.

2. THE CONTRACTOR IS TO PROVIDE A LUMP SUM BID FOR THE WORK DESCRIBED IN THE
BID DOCUMENTS. CONTRACTOR SHALL ALSO PROVIDE UNIT COST PRICING FOR ITEMS
DESCRIBED IN BID MANUAL.

3. ALL WORK IS TO BE PERFORMED UNDER A SINGLE OVERALL CONTRACT WITH THE DIRECT
SUPERVISION OF THE GENERAL CONTRACTOR.

4. NO ATTEMPT HAS BEEN MADE TO DIVIDE THE DRAWINGS INTO AREAS OF RESPONSIBILITY
FOR THE VARIOUS TRADES. IT IS TO BE THE CONTRACTOR'S SOLE RESPONSIBILITY TO
DIVIDE THE WORK AMONG HIS SUBCONTRACTORS, AND HE IS TO BE FULLY RESPONSIBLE
FOR THE COORDINATION OF ANY TRADE USED ON THIS PROJECT.

5. IT IS THE INTENT OF THE CONTRACT DOCUMENTS TO PROVIDE AN INSTALLATION
COMPLETE IN EVERY RESPECT. IN THE EVENT THAT ADDITIONAL DETAILS OR SPECIAL
CONSTRUCTION IS REQUIRED FOR WORK' INDICATED OR SPECIFIED, IT SHALL BE THE
RESPONSIBILITY OF THAT CONTRACTOR TO PROVIDE ALL MATERIAL & EQUIPMENT WHICH IS
USUALLY FURNISHED WITH SUCH SYSTEMS IN ORDER TO COMPLETE THE INSTALLATION,
WHETHER MENTIONED OR NOT.

6. DRAWINGS AND SPECIFICATIONS ARE COMPLEMENTARY. MATERIAL OR EQUIPMENT NEED
BE SHOWN ON ONLY ONE OR THE OTHER. EACH TRADE, SUPPLIER, OR SUBCONTRACTOR
SHALL BE RESPONSIBLE TO EXAMINE THE ENTIRE SET OF DRAWINGS AND ALL SECTIONS OF
THE SPECIFICATIONS TO DETERMINE WHAT MATERIALS, EQUIPMENT, ACCESSORIES, ETC. ARE
NEEDED FOR A COMPLETE INSTALLATION.

BIDDING:

1. THE CONTRACTOR IS TO VISIT AND INSPECT THE PROJECT SITE, PRIOR TO PREPARING
HIS BID, IN ORDER TO OBTAIN ALL REQUIRED FIELD MEASUREMENTS, TO VERIFY ALL
DIMENSIONS SHOWN ON THE DRAWINGS AS REQUIRED, TO CONFIRM QUANTITIES AND
METHODS OF CONSTRUCTIONS, AND TO COMPLETELY FAMILIARIZE HIMSELF WITH ALL FIELD
CONDITIONS AND LIMITATIONS, THE INTENT OF THE DESIGN, AND THE EXTENT OF THE WORK.

2. THE SUBMISSION OF A BID IS TO BE CONSTRUED AS EVIDENCE THAT A THOROUGH FIELD
EXAMINATION OF THE PROJECT SITE HAS BEEN MADE. FAILURE OF THE CONTRACTOR TO
FAMILIARIZE HIMSELF WITH THE DRAWINGS RELATING TO THE WORK, THE CONDITIONS
EXISTING AT THE SITE OF CONSTRUCTION, AND/OR THE POSSIBLE DIFFICULTIES THAT MAY
BE ENCOUNTERED IN THE EXECUTION OF THE WORK UNDER THE CONTRACT WILL NOT
RELIEVE HIM OF HIS OBLIGATION TO FURNISH ALL MATERIALS AND LABOR NECESSARY TO
CARRY OUT THE PROVISIONS OF THE DRAWINGS AND TO COMPLETE THE CONTEMPLATED
WORK FOR THE CONSIDERATION SET FORTH IN HIS BID.

3. SUBCONTRACTORS ARE TO REVIEW ALL DRAWINGS, SPECIFICATIONS, AND DETAILS FOR
ADDITIONAL WORK AND ARE RESPONSIBLE TO COORDINATE THEIR WORK WITH OTHER
TRADES.

4. ANY ADDITIONAL WORK/CHANGES FROM THE ORIGINAL SCOPE OF WORK NECESSARY TO
MAKE THE WORK OF EACH SUBCONTRACTOR CONFORM TO THE OVERALL PLAN AND THE
WORK OF OTHER TRADES SHALL BE DONE AT THE APPROPRIATE CONTRACTOR'S EXPENSE.

5. CONTRACTOR SHALL PROVIDE FOR THE FOLLOWING IN HIS BID:
— COSTS OF DEMOLITION / OFF-SITE DISPOSAL & AREA PREPARATION

— REMOVAL / RELOCATION / REINSTALLATION AS REQ'D TO PERFORM WORK
— FINAL HOOK-UP OF ALL ELECTRICAL ITEMS

ALLOWANCES:

1. CONTRACTOR SHALL INCLUDE IN HIS PROPOSAL A $10000 ALLOWANCE TO USE TOWARDS
REPLACEMENT OF EQUIPMENT & ITEMS THAT CANNOT BE REINSTALLED AS INTENDED IN THE
BLEACHER SCOPE OF WORK, AS WELL AS ANY ADDITIONAL UNFORESEEN ITEMS NEEDED FOR
THE FINAL INSTALLATION. ALLOWANCE MAY BE USED FOR:

— PURCHASE OF NEW WIRING HARNESSES & MOTORS

— PURCHASE OF NEW POWER TRACTORS WITH DRIVE WHEELS & GEARBOXES

— PURCHASE OF NEW BLEACHER FRAMES

— PURCHASE OF ANY OTHER COMPONENTS OF THE INSTALLATION THAT ARE SUBSTANDARD
& REQUIRE REPLACEMENT / REPAIR

— NEW ELECTRICAL WIRING, CONDUIT & CONTROLS (IE. LIMIT SWITCHES, DELAY SWITCHES,
PENDANT CONTROLS AND PENDANT RECEPTACLE BOXES) IF NEEDED

EXISTING CONDITIONS:

1. PLANS ARE BASED ON RECORD DRAWINGS PROVIDED BY MSU AND, BY THEIR NATURE,
MAY NOT NECESSARILY REVEAL ALL CONDITIONS THAT EXIST AT THE PROJECT SITE. THE
CONTRACTOR IS TO FULLY INVESTIGATE THE PROJECT SITE AND CAREFULLY CONFIRM ALL
EXISTING CONDITIONS PRIOR TO CONSTRUCTION AND ADVISE THE ARCHITECT IMMEDIATELY
WHEN ANY DISCREPANCIES OCCUR.

SHOP DRAWINGS:

1. SHOP DRAWINGS / MSDS/ OTHER PRODUCT DATA FOR ALL MATERIALS USED ON THIS
PROJECT SHALL BE SUBMITTED FOR REVIEW PRIOR TO THEIR INSTALLATION. PROCEDURES
FOR SUBMITTALS (IE. TYPES REQUIRED, NUMBER OF COPIES, ETC.) SHALL BE DISCUSSED AT
THE PRE—CONSTRUCTION MEETING.

PERMITS:

1. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL OBTAIN & PAY FOR ALL PERMITS & LICENSES
NECESSARY FOR THE COMPLETION OF THIS WORK. SUBCONTRACTORS SHALL BE LICENSED,
BONDED, INSURED, & CAPABLE OF PERFORMING QUALITY WORKMANSHIP.

APPROVALS:
1. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL ARRANGE FOR AND OBTAIN ALL INSPECTIONS AND
APPROVALS AND CERTIFICATES OF OCCUPANCY.

REGULATORY REQUIREMENTS:

1. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL CONFORM TO ALL APPLICABLE LOCAL, COUNTY, STATE AND
FEDERAL CODES, LAWS & REQUIREMENTS, MOST RECENTLY ADOPTED EDITIONS, INCLUDING,
BUT NOT LIMITED TO:

- NJAC § 5:23-6 "REHABILITATION SUBCODE”

INTERNATIONAL BUILDING CODE — 2018, NJ EDITION

NATIONAL ELECTRICAL CODE / NFPA 70 — 2017, NJ ED.

BARRIER-FREE SUBCODE NJAC 5:23-7 ICC/ANSI 117.1-2009

2. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL FEDERAL AND STATE LABOR LAWS &
REGULATIONS CONCERNING WAGES, HIRING PRACTICES & TRAINING.

3. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL FEDERAL, STATE, AND LOCAL LAWS,

OSHA RULES & REGULATIONS, & BUILDING / CONSTRUCTION CODES CONCERNING
CONSTRUCTION SAFETY & HEALTH STANDARDS.

4. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL COMPLY WITH ALL FEDERAL, STATE & LOCAL ORDINANCES
ASSOCIATED WITH ENVIRONMENTAL PROTECTION MEASURES, ENERGY EFFICIENCY, DEMOLITION
& DISPOSAL, AND NOISE & DUST CONTROL IN PUBLIC AREAS.

GUARANTEE:

1. ALL LABOR AND MATERIALS SHALL BE GUARANTEED FOR ONE (1) YEAR AFTER THE
DATE OF FINAL ACCEPTANCE OF WORK OF THE PROJECT, BUT ANY LONGER GUARANTEES
GIVEN BY MANUFACTURERS OR SUPPLIERS SHALL NOT BE LIMITED BY THE FOREGOING.

QUALITY ASSURANCE:

1. ALL WORK SHALL BE INSTALLED, FIRSTLY, IN ACCORDANCE WITH ALL LAWS, CODES,
ORDINANCES AND REQUIREMENTS OF THE GOVERNING AUTHORITIES, AND SECONDLY, IN
ACCORDANCE WITH THE REQUIREMENTS SET FORTH HEREIN, AND ALSO PER THE

MANUFACTURER'S INSTALLATION REQUIREMENTS.

2. ALL WORKMEN SHALL BE SKILLED IN THEIR TRADES, & SHALL INSTALL MATERIALS
IN- STRICT COMPLIANCE WITH REGULATIONS, DRAWINGS & SPECIFICATIONS.

3. CONTRACTOR SHALL EMPLOY & PAY FOR THE SERVICES OF AN INDEPENDENT
TESTING AGENCY TO PERFORMED REQUIRED TESTING & INSPECTIONS.

MATERIALS:

1. ALL MATERIALS SHALL BE NEW. ALL MATERIALS, DEVICES AND EQUIPMENT SHALL
CONFORM TO THE APPLICABLE STANDARDS OF ANSI, ASTM, NFPA, OSHA, AND UL. IN ANY
INSTANCE WHERE THESE SPECIFICATIONS CALL FOR MATERIALS FOR CONSTRUCTION OF A
BETTER QUALITY OR LARGER SIZE THAN REQUIRED BY THE CODES, THE PROVISIONS OF
THESE SPECIFICATIONS SHALL TAKE PRECEDENCE. ALL WORK OF THIS PROJECT SHALL BE
CAREFULLY COORDINATED WITH ALL INVOLVED TRADES. PROVIDE ALL NEEDFUL SAFETY
DEVICES & PRECAUTIONS.

3. CONTRACTORS SHALL BID ON SPECIFIED PRODUCTS & SYSTEMS WITHOUT DEVIATION.
EQUIVALENT PRODUCTS MAY BE SUBMITTED FOR CONSIDERATION DURING THE PRODUCT
REVIEW/SUBMITTAL PERIOD; GENERALLY, ACCEPTABLE SUBSTITUTIONS ARE ACCOMPANIED
BY A CREDIT TO THE OWNER.

SITE SECURITY:

1. CONTRACTORS SHALL COORDINATE WORK WITH APPROVAL OF MONTCLAIR STATE
UNIVERSITY & MAINTAIN SITE SECURITY AT ALL TIMES. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL
COORDINATE THE ACTIVITIES OF WORKERS WITH THE UNIVERSITY'S CALENDAR
REQUIREMENTS, AS WELL AS WORK HOURS.

CONTINUING OCCUPANCY:

1. THE CONTRACTOR IS HEREBY ADVISED THAT STAFF & STUDENTS WILL CONTINUE TO
OCCUPY THE EXISTING BUILDING DURING THIS CONTRACT. THE CONTRACTOR IS TO CAREFULLY
SCHEDULE AND COORDINATE HIS WORK SO AS NOT TO REASONABLY DISTURB ANY STAFF MEMBERS
& STUDENTS IN THE BUILDING AND IS TO BE HELD RESPONSIBLE FOR ANY STAFF-RELATED COSTS
INCURRED THEREBY.

CONTRACTOR'S USE OF SITE:

1. THERE IS NO ON-SITE PARKING AVAILABLE FOR CONSTRUCTION PERSONNEL.

LIMITED SITE USE: COMPLY WITH MONTCLAIR STATE

UNIVERSITY RULES & REGULATIONS FOR CONSTRUCTION VEHICLES, EQUIPMENT, TRAILERS, &
PRODUCT STORAGE, ETC.

GENERAL NOTES:

1. ALL CONTRACTORS MUST PROTECT ALL PROPERTY FROM DAMAGE OR LOSS DURING
THE CONTRACT. ALL DAMAGED, LOST, OR OTHERWISE DISRUPTED PROPERTY IS TO BE
REPAIRED OR REPLACED TO THE SATISFACTION OF THE OWNER.

2. CONTRACTORS ARE RESPONSIBLE FOR: SCHEDULING, THE PURCHASE, DELIVERY,
RECEIVING, UNLOADING, STORING & SETTING IN PLACE OF ALL EQUIPMENT REQUIRED FOR
THE PROJECT.

3. SUBCONTRACTORS ARE RESPONSIBLE FOR SAFEGUARDING OF ALL MATERIALS UNTIL
INCORPORATED INTO THE WORK AND UNTIL ACCEPTANCE OF SUBSTANTIAL COMPLETION.

4. ALL CONTRACTORS ARE TO MAINTAIN THE PREMISES IN A NEAT & ORDERLY
CONDITION DURING THIS CONTRACT. DISPOSE OF ALL DEBRIS AT THE END OF EACH DAYS
WORK.

5. AT PROJECT COMPLETION, CONTRACTOR SHALL REMOVE AND LEGALLY DISPOSE OF
ALL RUBBISH, WASTE MATERIAL & OTHER MATERIALS. REMOVE ALL TOOLS, VEHICLES,

SURPLUS MATERIAL, ETC. FROM/ABOUT THE WORK SITE.

6. STORAGE, BURNING, OR SALE OF DEMOLISHED, REMOVED, AND/OR DISCARDED
MATERIALS IS NOT TO BE PERMITTED ON THE PROJECT SITE.

1. THE CONTRACTOR IS TO INVESTIGATE & NOTIFY ARCHITECT OF ANY DISCREPANCIES

PRIOR TO THE START OF WORK. SAFE OFF AND CAP/TERMINATE AS REQUIRED FOR
PERFORMANCE OF THE WORK.

GENERAL NOTES, CONTINUED:

8. CONTRACTORS SHALL PROVIDE SANITARY FACILITIES FOR THE WORKERS. SANITARY
FACILITES ARE TO BE MAINTAINED IN A CLEAN AND SANITARY CONDITION AT ALL TIMES,
AND ARE TO COMPLY WITH THE REQUIREMENTS OF THE LOCAL HEALTH AUTHORITY. USE OF
THE OWNER'S SANITARY FACILITIES ARE PROHIBITED.

9 ALL CONTRACTORS SHALL HAVE TEMPORARY (CELL) PHONE FOR USE ON THE SITE
DURING CONSTRUCTION. USE OF OWNER'S TELEPHONES ARE PROHIBITED.

10. CONTRACTORS SHALL MAINTAIN A CLEAR PATH OF TRAVEL FOR ALL EXISTING
REQUIRED EXITS, WAYS OF APPROACH THERETO, AND WAY OF TRAVEL FROM BUILDING
EXITS INTO THE STREET FOR UNOBSTRUCTED EGRESS IN THE CASE OF FIRE OR OTHER
EMERGENCY.  GENERAL CONTRACTOR SHALL NOT PARK VEHICLES OR STORE MATERIALS IN

"NO PARKING” OR "FIRE" ZONES.

1. CONTRACTOR SHALL RESTORE ALL ADJACENT AREAS DISTURBED DURING THE
COURSE OF WORK.

12. ALL DIMENSIONS INDICATED ON THE DRAWINGS ARE FINISH FACE TO FINISH FACE,
UNLESS OTHERWISE NOTED.

13. DRAWINGS SHOW THE GENERAL ARRANGEMENT & THE EXTENT OF THE WORK.
EXACT LOCATION AND EQUIPMENT ARRANGEMENT SHALL BE DETERMINED BY THE PHYSICAL
DIMENSIONS OF THE SITE, FIELD MEASUREMENTS AND/OR DIRECTION OF THE ARCHITECT.
CONTRACTOR SHALL BE ULTIMATELY RESPONSIBLE FOR THE FINAL INSTALLATION &
LOCATION OF ALL WORK.

4. INDICATION OF SUBSTRATE AND CONFIGURATION OF CONCEALED ITEMS AND
MATERIALS FOR GENERAL REFERENCE ONLY. THE CONTRACTOR SHALL NOT BE ENTITLED TO
ADDITIONAL COMPENSATION FOR ANY VARIANCE BETWEEN ACTUAL EXISTING CONDITIONS
AND THAT REFERENCED ON THE DRAWINGS.

15, ALL ITEMS LABELED 'EXISTING" ARE EXISTING "TO REMAIN" UNLESS OTHERWISE
INDICATED. ITEMS NOT LABELED "EXISTING” ARE TO BE PROVIDED BY CONTRACTOR.

16.  THE TERM "PROVIDE™ SHALL MEAN FURNISH AND INSTALL AS IT IS USED
THROUGHOUT NOTES ON THE DRAWINGS AND IN THE SPECIFICATIONS.

PROJECT CONTACTS:

MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
1 NORMAL AVENUE
MONTCLAIR, NJ 07043
www.montclair.edu

USER /OWNER:

FACILITIES CONTACT: MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY

CAPITAL PLANNING / PROJECT MANAGEMENT DEPT.
150 CLOVE ROAD

LITTLE FALLS, NJ

OFFICE: 973.655.7789

MOBILE: 973.868.4544

ATIN: ADAM MCGUIRE

ARCHITECT: _ HERBST-MUSCIANO, LLC
GARY MUSCIANO, PRINCIPAL
611 MAIN STREET 2ND FLR
BOONTON, NJ 07005
973.538.3815

DRAWING LIST:

T-01 TITLE SHEET

A\
<D—O‘I DEMO PLANS, NOTES & SECTIONS

A—-01 PROPOSED PLANS, LEGEND, DIAGRAMS & NOTES

A—02 EXISTING & PROPOSED BANK A PLAN, NOTES, LEGEND,
SCHEDULES & SECTIONS

A—-03 EXISTING & PROPOSED BANK B & C PLANS, SECTIONS,
SCHEDULES & NOTES

A—-04 DETAILS

A—05 WALL PADDING DIAGRAM, PARTIAL PLANS & NOTES

A—06 WALL PADDING ELEVATIONS

A—-07 WALL GRILLES DETAILS, PARTIAL PLAN, ELEVATION &

NOTES

L s

N PARTIAL CAMPUS MAP

GOOGLE NOT TO SCALE

NORTH

BLDG KEYMAP

NOT TO SCALE

e

NORTH

"WORK AREA’

Ssseelel
I

i
Icationta

{Eommtn

I
HERBS

MUSCIANCG
I

611 MAIN STREET

2ND FLOOR

BOONTON, NJ 07005
TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815
FAX 973—-538-4095

GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP

NJ RA C-8078 Ml 1301045424
NY RA 021687 MN 48411

CA 29549 MO A2009005517
CO 401804 NV 5015

CT 7547 NC 9671

DC ARC6052 OHIO 9510925

DE S5-0008180 PA RA403281

FL ARO014044 Rl 2030

GA RA 012998 SC 8651

IA RA 06841 TN CERT. No.105438
IL RA 001.020501 TEXAS 15417

IN AR11300067 UT 8470051—-0301
KS 5073 VT 2529

LA 5690 VA 0401008254
MD 11039 WA 11037

MA 10131

N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830

NJ PLANNER 4351

CONSULTANTS

NO.:

REVISIONS

DATE:

>

5.19.2020 REVISION

3104.27.20

100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT

2104.24.20

90% REVIEW

1103.18.20

CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK

NO.:

DATE:

SUBMISSIONS &

CLIENT / PROJECT:

Montclair State University

iT'S ALL HERE.

1 HORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | 07043

MSU PROJ. #21C002

PANZER GYM

FLOOR AND BLEACHERS
REFURBISHMENT

MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
T NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
NEW JERSEY 07043

DRAWING TITLE:

TITLE SHEET,
PROJECT INFO,
REQUIREMENTS &

NOTES

oM AS NOTED
DT 02.25.20
oM 7626

THIS DESIGN IS COPYRIGHTED AND

DRAWING NO.

PROTECTED UNDER THE LAWS OF THE

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA. ANY
UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT
WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE
ARCHITECT IS PROHIBITED.

T-01

06/2016

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"



I
HERBS

MUSCIANCG
I

. — N LLC
( ‘ J ‘ 611 MAIN STREET
2ND FLOOR
HHE. 3 e | | BOONTON, NJ 07005
13'—4}” OPEN DIMENSION S ‘ ‘ | | TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815
: FAX 973-538-4095
o o EXIST'G CRASH MATTING EXIST'G EXIST'G CRASH MATTING -
1<_1|, 2'_g” »4 ROWS @ 2'—9"= 8’—1%” = —45 (12L X 6'H ) (6L X6H) (22L X 6'H ) :
! GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP
2 ! NJ RA C-8078 MI 1301045424
© - ! — — NY RA 021687 MN 48411
2 2 @ ! [ CO 401804 NV sois
2 & — ! - = | CT 7547 NC 9671
p ® | ) ] | ml ! DC ARC6052 OHIO 9510925
A= n ™ | = ! DE S5-0008180 PA RA403281
oL % ’ ~d I oA A 012998 Sc @b
< %2 | Kﬁo N I IA RA 06841 TN CERT. No.105438
= x i - 3 } IL RA 001.020501 TEXAS 15417
— L H | ——— G [ I IN AR11300067 UT 8470051-0301
RN ‘ | % || | || iy , KS 5073 VT 2529
: | = || i E 1| e I s [l ! LA 5690 VA 0401008254
4’'—-0z" ! % | C 7 Il 3 ! mi m 12)(1);? WA 11037 i
CLOSED DIMENSION i i ‘ % J Bi J wA oI N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830
13’'—47" OPEN DIMENSION i 0 7 B A 1 bl CONSULTANTS
o o o P (7 _ 3] ! oﬂ) i oo oo
-1 22-9” , 3 ROWS @ 2'—9"= 8'-3" , /' ~°1% ! N ] e e e
i H/S = — ‘:C;: ] ) U): 2 N t . 14
| 2 g gl N 0 8l | i
00 ) ) ) ) NN |
. 7RIz ERG AN ‘ ‘ i [
Te) - L ‘_i L o LJ/K\ B \\\\ j T / ZC i A
N o SN N NI N NN\ L I e
—o| © Cr _ : Eﬁi | z
ik 0 | ) g = N 7
MR o | - ol | |
E:_CKD\‘ : e () I
— I 2 x| l
A N ’ R i (ied |
1 3)_2%11 L i % 9 g: i e
| 0 =3 |
CLOSED DIMENSION : &l |
il i
| = |
21'—=77" OPEN DIMENSION i ;g (o] g/ i
—/z n wn %) [ ] [T 11 ] B
L Vam g E QE QE i . o REVISIONS
14y 6 ROWS ©@ 29" 164" r_gr O (B0 (F 0 | /N 5.19.2020 REVISION
o = XX e X
- Slus (el
Nio oo
[m)]
Ll |1
: S A : &
® ol
L) I —
o i , Lol
~ < <t <t
‘ © 0 (F 0[O —
n o i
o 0O [m)] (@)
w ol L il )
2 X pE X pE X (5) METAL GRILLES TO BE
| ﬁ :i ﬁ ﬁ REPLACED; APPROXL 20" X 40 |
Ns _ | o [[Jel[je
S — | Il
| |
! El ”» iy I U‘ i
= 8 ERRRAARRI —
CLOSED DIMENSION ! g — = = 3/04.27.20| 100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT
|
' | i = T | : 2|04.24.20| 90% REVIEW
=1
EXIST'G BLEACHERS | @ (}O% % | _ 1/03.18.20 | CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK
0 2’ 4’ 8’ 12° I o / | ' NO..  DATE:
. I n : I SUBMISSIONS 4
|—|_|_|_| ] ni | Ul 5 4 C%EZ % i CLIENT / PROJECT:
SCALE: 1/4” = 1'-0" == = S N/ | | N\ 8l ; . ) )
b J L i | Montclair State University
4 I H i I
4R R D % |
| = = 1T HORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | O7043
' B 1 NN NN N
! Oj) g MR RN
I E |
DEMO NOTES I 7 B R MSU PROJ. #ZICOOZ
DEML NV TE ! i e R e e
i @ ; 1 vy
BANKS C: i = E ] )+ ! PANZER GYM
1. DISASSEMBLE 1ST AND 2ND ROW IN ITS ENTIRETY—INCLUDING SEATS AND DECKING FROM EXISTING | | ! % — % i FLOOR AND BLEACHERS
HUSSEY MAXAM TELESCOPIC BLEACHER SYSTEM. | A ot i | REFURBISHMENT
2. REMOVE 2ND TIER POWER FRAME DRIVE SYSTEM IN ITS ENTIRETY—= INCLUDING MOTOR, GEAR BOX, I L] = : MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
TORQUE TUBES AND WIRING HARNESS. : (% #l |
i fﬁoﬁ ! 1 NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
GYM FLOOR: ! < 1 i NEW JERSEY 07043
1. SAND THE ENTIRE FLOOR TO BARE WOOD USING A GYM RIDE ON SANDER USING COURSE, MEDIUM K ] d (ﬁo% !
AND FINE GRITS.( EXCLUDES AREAS THAT ARE INACCESSIBLE LIKE UNDER BLEACHERS). & ! DRAWING TITLE:
2. HANDSCRAPE ALL EDGES AND CORNERS. — & |
3. CLEAN SURFACE BY VACUUMING AND THEN TACK WITH DAMP TOWELS. g, Imimia B DEMO PLANS, NOTES
| & SECTIONS
EXIST'G CRASH MATTING (2LX6H) ( ( ( ( F F i(
(3BLX6EH) EXISTG ‘ L
[ s d ! H—L—’T 1 L‘ - L
| | ] M NNl
L} i JL LT 1 I
PROJECT MANAGER: SCALE:
GM AS NOTED
___________________________________________________]
ﬁ ] DT 02.25.20
CHECKED BY: PROJECT NO.:

EXIST'G FLOORPLAN oM Joze
0+ & 5 24 HREESTIOID 0w 0

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA. ANY
UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT
NORTH WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE
ARCHITECT IS PROHIBITED. -—

SCALE: 1/8" = 1"-0"

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"

06/2016




] I H
( ‘ WALL
A,QL A | | | L‘ | PADDING
20'—4" ‘ v ‘ 4'—4" ‘ ‘ 34'-2" -
] g_O; L > | EL |
i NONTELAIR BTATE o
i i |
% n‘?n
- 4 \__J i
T o |
D - |
- AN | L SA [BAnK| & :
=l mill| l || I E f
E3 AL = Nl
) /’@ Ch 3:
. 0 @\ T 0 ;
5 P J ?ﬁom;g
oD
e <
o 3 N
ﬁ— >4 57
L D
; % BANK
E E O H 1 [ [T “[ -
| 2 > QT o=l im m
i =8 Gh
=D pd il |
L |[eD - 7T B }
|| 5
IO, :
E Eo /Cv BANK C g_:
L TN\ ]
is | R /@ %
B ] @)-\ | - I @
E \ JEAVEIRSEHIIVEIEIFIANIOIN =2 ]
5 plililiiuni!
8” | 50'-0" | 8”7 | 10°—1" |
i I » — u - - ﬁ ? ' |
i | LA AT Ry J( H |
PROPOSED FLOORPLAN
0 4’ 8’ 16’ 24’
NORTH
SCALE: 1/8” = 1'-0" \J\
8 —4" 84" {

v

M

1"=p’

3

Ni;

5L AT TAT

o

PARTIAL FLOORPLAN

®

0
NORTH

2,—8" 5!_4"

SCALE: 3/16" = 1'-0"

10,—8”

16,—0”

\J\

NORTH

LEGEND
SELF STRONG

TELESCOPIC SEATING

-~ | RAILED END L AlSLE STEP —— IN CLOSED POSITION
. (SEE DETAIL) S
WHEELCHAIR
& INDICATES SECTION é_j\. ACCESS SPACE POWER SUPPLY
# FOR BANK (33"Wx48"D) = (WALL MOUNTED)
" —1° FOOT LEVEL COMPANION _ PENDANT CONTROL
AISLE C SEAT (18"W) Eo—
= = FLOOR OUTLET
AISLE HAND COMPANION
RAIL SPACE (24”W) —— \WALL PADDING
y S 18m 3 N
9m ' L Sm
KT ; N ] 2 05
Lo 2" g AN
.05m Ki x b[
| | T 1 | )
Tsideline \__/
U
w
=
-
o
—
_|
5 / \ 2}.\ -
m Fd A
3
c =
7-_U| g
MK——.05m
.051 sideline N K—.05m 05m  D{K——.05m e ni.osm—bﬁ
= - : e n- Fa = A
| center line E — —
end line Eattack line end line
5 =
3 z

(28" - Women’s Line - Recommended)
2-Inches Wide by 2-Inches Long -———_,y

mel not un!
i e AUT-0F-BOUNDS AREA 2020-21 season for Divisions Il and lll men’s basketball.
(: ecommended) « This diagram is not drawn to scale.

- Women’s Line - Re MINIMUM of 3°.
2-Inches Wide by 2-Inches Long ferable 10° unobstructed space outside.

—

1 S
RESTRAINING
|« LINE

[« 47" to the center of the division line
9%

\___ SIDELINE

END LINE |
(Must b at least 8" wide if a contrasting color belt)

1
RESTRAINING
LINE ——y |

\

MEN'S
THREE-POINT
LINE

&

10 x10°
COMMERCIAL
ADVERTISING AREA

TT—ENDLINE
(Must be at least 8" wide if a contrasting color belt)

WOMEN'S
THREE-POINT
19"

WOMEN ONLY_
12°LONG BY
2°WIDE

T

/ LINE

18107

Optimum width
50" inside

sidelines l<—g3"

15
(to the outside edge
of the free throw line)
FREE-THROW

2 LINE
tothe |«

T [\
L

12" WiDE
i 4/‘

BY 8"

WOMEN ONLY
12°LONG BY
2"WIDE

-~ ———f

DIVISION
LINE

CENTER

CIRCLE\

WOMEN ONLY.
12°LONG BY
2°WIDE

l— 66—

] ] ] n
T T || ]

o !

P =
Y r
@ 'WOMEN ONLY

12°LONGBY
2"WIDE

D 1 Ra—

NCAA FLOOR STRIPING PLAN

al

A'A

Ol=<

o

\J\

PARTIAL FLOORPLAN

0

2,—8” 51_4”

10,—8"

16,—0"

SCALE: 3/16" =

11_01)

AN “X,” NCAA LOGO ORNCAA 10°x10°
BASKETBALL LOGO IS REQUIRED. COMMERCIAL
SEE RULE 1_3.3‘,\ ADVERTISING AREA
2 WIDE— \ 2"WIDE

‘ \ 2" WIDE \ '
51 i \\ s 3
l 3 3

" !

38" COACHING BOX z* x ; | 38 COACHING BOX
28" TEAM BENCH AREA * i i I\\ 2" WIDE < 28'TEAMBENCH AREA
COURTSIDE COURTSIDE
Approximately 3"to 12" from the boundary lines. SCORERS' TABLE Approximately 3" to 12 from the boundary lines.

IMPORTANT NOTE:
PRIOR TO PAINTING LINES, BORDERS, LETTERING AND LOGO,

MOCKUP IS REQUIRED WITH OWNER/ARCHITECT FOR APPROVAL OF
ALL COLORS

PMS COLORS:_
WHITE (@ 2" BASKETBALL COURT LINES
BLUE 281 (® 2" VOLLEYBALL LINES

COOL GRAY 3 (3) 1" PRACTICE BASKETBALL LINES

TAN 467 C (@ 1" PRACTICE VOLLEYBALL LINES
RED 200 C (5 3" BASKETBALL 3—POINT LINES
WHITE ® NCAA LOGO

GRAY 425 C () CENTER COURT MSU MASCOT BORDER
RED 200 C (8 CENTER COURT MSU MASCOT FEATHERS
WHITE (9 CENTER COURT MSU MASCOT EYE
COOL GRAY 3 (0 CENTER COURT MSU MASCOT BEAK
GRAY 425 C () BASKETBALL COURT BORDER

CONSTRUCTION NOTES
1. PREPARE GYM FLOOR FOR NEW LINES AND UNIVERSITY
LOGO AS SHOWN.

2. PROTECT ALL FLOOR OUTLETS DURING CONSTRUCTION.
3. ALL COURT LINES ARE 2" WIDE UNLESS NOTED
OTHERWISE.

4, G.C. TO COORDINATE WITH OWNER ON APPROPRIATE
FONT STYLE AND DETAILING OF "MONTCLAIR STATE” &
"NCAA” ON COURT.

5. PROTECT EXISTING WALL PADDING AND PREP IT FOR
N PADDIN Q_BE-ID ALLED:

6. APPLY TWO COATS OF MFMA APPROVED IL MODIFIED
POLYURETHANE TO SEAL THE SURFACE. THE FLOOR WILL BE
SCREENED AND CLEANED BETWEEN COATS USING DUSTLESS
BUFFERS TO PROVIDE A SMOOTH FINISH.

7. PAINT LINES, BORDERS, LETTERING AND OVERSIZED
CENTER LOGO AS PER DRAWING.

8. ABRADE THE PAINT AND APPLY A 3RD AND 4TH COAT
OF BONA SPORTPOLY 350— MFMA 350 VOC COMPLIANT OIL
MODIFIED POLYURETHANE.

ENERAL NOTES

. DEALER WILL VERIFY ALL DIMENSIONS AND INFORMATION
SHOWN, INSURE THAT ALL FIELD CHECKED INTERMEDIATE
DIMENSION EQUAL THEIR CORRESPONDING OVERALL DIMENSION,
AND RETURN THIS DRAWING WITH THE APPROPRIATE
SIGNATURES FOR FURTHER ACTION.

G
1

2. HUSSEY SEATING CO. WILL ASSUME RESPONSIBILITY FOR
MANUFACTURING AND SUPPLYING PRODUCT ACCORDING TO
THIS DRAWING AND APPROVAL.

5. THE ARCHITECT, GENERAL CONTRACTOR AND OWNER WILL
INSURE THAT FLOORING IS LEVEL WITHIN £1/8" IN 8—0" AND
THAT THE FLOORING IS CONTINUES.

4. THE LAYOUT SHOWN IS DRAWN PER INTERPRETATIONS OF:
IBC 2000.

5. HUSSEY RESERVES THE RIGHT TO MAKE CHANGES WITHOUT
NOTICE WHEN, IN THE OPINION OF THE COMPANY, SUCH
CHANGES IMPROVE THE PRODUCT OR IT'S PERFORMANCE.

6. MATCH ALL FINISHES/ MATERIALS TO EXISTING CONDITIONS.

7. COURT LINES COLOR MATCH EXISTING.

BANK SUMMARY

BANK: A, B & C
MODEL: BANK A MAXAM PLUS (FREE STANDING)
BANKS B & C COMBO MAXAM PLUS / MAXAM 26
(FREE STANDING)
RISE: 9 5/8”
ROW SPACING: BANK A =33"; BANK B & C=33"
TIERS 1+2, 26” TIERS 3-8
TIERS: BANK A=4; BANK B & C=8 (7 SEATING)

I
HERBS

MUSCIANCG
I

LLC

611 MAIN STREET
2ND FLOOR
BOONTON, NJ 07005

TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815

FAX 973—-538-4095

GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP

NJ RA C-8078
NY RA 021687
CA 29549

CO 401804

CT 7547

DC ARC6052

DE S5-0008180

FL ARO014044
GA RA 012998
IA RA 06841

IL RA 001.020501

IN AR11300067
KS 5073
LA 5690
MD 11039
MA 10131

NJ PLANNER 4351

CONSULTANTS

Ml 1301045424

MN 48411

MO A2009005517
NV 5015

NC 9671

OHIO 9510925

PA RA403281

Rl 2030

SC 8651

TN CERT. No.105438
TEXAS 15417

UT 8470051—-0301
VT 2529

VA 0401008254

WA 11037

N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830

NO.:

DATE:

REVISIONS

>

5.19.2020Q

REVISION

3

04.27.20

100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT

2

04.24.20

90% REVIEW

1

03.18.20

CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK

NO.:

DATE:

SUBMISSIONS &

CLIENT / PROJECT:

Montclair State University
n"s ALL HERE.

1T HORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | O7043

MSU PROJ. #21C002

PANZER GYM

FLOOR AND BLEACHERS
REFURBISHMENT
MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
T NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
NEW JERSEY 07043

DR

AWING TITLE:

PROPOSED PLANS,
DIAGRAMS, LEGEND

& NOTES
oM AS NOTED
. |
DT 02.25.20
oM 7626

THIS DESIGN IS COPYRIGHTED AND
PROTECTED UNDER THE LAWS OF THE
UNITED STATES OF AMERICA. ANY
UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT
WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE

ARCH

ITECT IS PROHIBITED.

DRAWING NO.

A-01

06/2016

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"



EXISTING BANK A PLA
0 S 16’ 24’

MAXAM PLUS

9 5/8" RISE
SECTION
0 1'-4" 2-8" 54" 8'—Q"
— | —

SCALE: 3/8" = 1'-0"

SEAT SUMMARY TOTAL
SEATING SUMMARY SEATING SUMMARY
SIZE QUANTITY SIZE QUANTITY
19" 0 19” 48
20" 27 20 46
21 0 21 15
29" 0 22" 0
23" 0 23 0
24" 0 24” 6
TOTAL: 27 METRO TOTAL SEAT COUNT: 139

COURT SIDE TOTAL SEAT COUNT:
TOTAL SEAT COUNT: 679

540

NORTH
SCALE: 1/8" = 1'—0"
[
NV FINSIH SCHEDULE
101'=0” AVAILABLE WALL SPACE X078 RISE
| | SECTION FINSIH SCHEDULE (MXM_PLUS)
5" TO POWER SUPPLY o TYP 0 1-4"2-8 5'—4" 8'—0" RAIL COLOR BLACK
| _ — — PANELS N/A
O | SCALE: 3/8” = 1'—0”
END CURTAINS N /A
DECKING 3/4” AC PLYWOOD WITH 2 COATS OF CLEAR POLYURETHANE
I UNDERSTRUCTURE BLACK ALKYD ENAMEL
— —1r — — NOSE & REAR RISER SILVER ZINC ALLOY MATTE
F&\\J %\\;\ %\J\ & lsle 18l o T=1le | (e 2l [ [2]e | R
5 SEATS . h@ |. @ ‘b ‘.‘© lc 5 SEATS SSEATSC {\‘;\ ,M‘((‘—\ (NN gSEATS 5 SEATS . {\‘;\ ,M‘(‘—\ C\ ‘M,{\(\‘—/\ 5 SEATS ETO REMOVABL -L | e
4-6"| /A | 487 5 4-6" (ACTUAL UNIT NOT] 1. K
—0 C E D \fz SHOWN)
o (S )| MAXAM PLUS
- 19’6 19'—6" 19"=6" 19’6 19’6 9 5/8” RISE
SECTION
@ @ @ @ @ ’ ” H ” H ” ’ ”
0 1'-4" 2-8 5'—4 8'—0
S A e A COURTSIDE SEAT FINISH SCHEDULE
SCALE: 3/8" = 1-0 COURTSIDE SEAT FINISH SCHEDULE (MXM26)
N PROPOSED BANK A PLAN SEAT 050 GREY
@Wﬂ”b R — e 24 RAIL BLACK
NORTH SCALE: 1/8" = 1'-0" Shes A
' - END CURTAINS N /A
DECKING 5/8” AC PLYWOOD WITH 2 COATS OF CLEAR POLYURETHANE
UNDERSTRUCTURE BLACK ALKYD ENAMEL
NOSE & REAR RISER SILVER ZINC ALLOY MATTE
10'=77%" OPEN DIMENSION
10'=77%" OPEN DIMENSION — |
= 2 ROWS @ 2'-9"=5'-6 2'-9" 1/-17:4
2 ROWS @ 2'-9"=5'-6", 2'=9” 1'—1:%"
. \ / BANK A 1ST ROW SCHEDULE
) | . B A
= L 7': " é,,
* L//‘ Q ‘ 3 RISERS @ W BES - Hﬂl 5-13
3 RISERS @ == =~ — - 05— 1 103" i N TO TOP OF BANK A
98"=1"-103" g 5= 1 MIN 3'-978" 8 8 4| CLEARANCE  SEAT A.F.F. 188 SEATS ON STAND, MAX. CAPACITY
- 4 CLEARANCE ~ TO TOP OF e ) I
i = - o SEAT AFE. 1,_33%,, L 1| i 108 SEATS ON STAND, AS SHOWN INTEGRAL POWER SUMMARY
(TS I | ‘ - | FIRST ROW SCHEDULE
|
" . ‘ 4’_0%" BANK | SECTION MODULE LAYOUT INTEGRAL POWER SUMMARY
4,_0_” |
CTOSED BIMENSION CLOSED DIMENSION A 1 3 5, 9 BANK | NO. OF PWR FRAME| CONTROL: | POWER SUPPLY
LETER|MOTORS| MODEL | PENDANT/KEY| LOCATION
A 2 5 5, 3
SECTION SECTION A 3 5 3 5 A 5 PF2 PENDANT 0'—6"
0 1'-4"2-8 5—4” 8—0" 0 1'-4" 2-8 5—4” 8'—0” A 4 3z 5 5 B 3 PF3 PENDANT 16’—6”
e Hﬂ - e H” - A 5 5 5 3 C 3 PF3 PENDANT 13'—6”
SCALE: 3/8” = 1'-0 SCALE: 3/8” = 1’0
POWER SPECIFICATIONS ACCESSORIES  NET SEAT: 453 ® 18" PER SEAT LEGEND
POWER SUPPLY DETAIL: (2 JUNCTION BOX LOCATIONS) ELECTRICAL SPECIFICATONS: ) Eill_ll_:E[?TEl\Cl)[,)\lG L - [,F\IEL(ISZI_SC()ZSI_I:D[I)CP%IES,?T'F'ICI)\II\(]S
Y. 1. 7— REMOVABLE FRONT STEPS 7. SEAT NUMBERS & ROW LETTERS "= (SEE DETAIL) - AISLE STEP
WITH NON—SLIP TREAD 8. 8 AISLE RAIL(S) MXM26 (BANKS B&C ONLY) ' WHEELCHAIR
- . 2. 7— FOOT LEVEL AISLES WITH NON-—SLIP 9. 7 AISLE RAIL(S) MAXAM PLUS (BANKS A, B C)
FACH MOTOR: 1/2HP, 120/208V, THREE PHASE, 1.25 SERVICE FACTOR . )
BANK B & C MANUAL LOCKING DISCONNECT oF INTEGRAL AOWER SOMMARY. GHART FOR QUANTIIES TREAD INTERMEDIATE AISLE STEP(S) 10. FLEX ROW ¢y  NDICATES SECTION G\, ACCESS SPACE POWER SUPPLY
12"X12"X6” JUNCTION NON—FUSED (BY E.C.) POWER SUPPLY: (SUPPLIED BY ELECTRICAL CONTRACTOR)(E.C.) 3. 2 READY RAILED ENDS (BANK B & C ONLY) 11. 3— MOTION MONITOR(S) # FOR BANK (33"Wx48"D) = (WALL MOUNTED)
pox BrECIETO SEATING POWER SUPPLY (BY E.C.) 20/208 VOLTS, 20 AMPS, 3 PHASE, 4 CONDUCTORS + GROUND COMBO ROW SPACING CONFIGURATION 12. INTEGRAL POWER WITH PENDANT CONTROL | | —
SEE ELECTRICAL SPECIFICATIONS MAXIMUM ALLOWABLE FULL LOAD VOLTAGE DROP IS 4%. 4. 2—SELF STRONG RAILED END(S) AND LIMIT SWITCHES .. FOOT LEVEL C COMPAngN > PENDANT CONTROL
BANK A MXMPLUS 13. COURTSIDE (PLASTIC) 10” SEAT AISLE SEAT (18"W) Fo—
12"X12"X6" JUNCTION 5. FRONT RAIL @ ADA: (BANK A SECT 3 ONLY) 14. CUSTOM STAIR UNIT (BANK A SECT 3 ONLY) o = = FLOOR OUTLET
BOX (BY EC) ¢ TO 6. CUSTOM PROGRAM SUPPORTS | 7 AISLE HAND COMPANION
BE 1—6" ABOVE FLOOR (BANK A ONLY) RA”_ SPACE (24”W) = WAl | PADDING

I
HERBS

MUSCIANCG
I

LLC

611 MAIN STREET
2ND FLOOR
BOONTON, NJ 07005

TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815

FAX 973—-538-4095

GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP

NJ RA C-8078
NY RA 021687

CA 29549
CO 401804
CT 7547

DC ARC6052

DE S5-0008180

FL AR0014044

GA RA 012998

IA RA 06841

IL RA 001.020501
IN AR11300067

KS 5073
LA 5690
MD 11039
MA 10131

NJ PLANNER 4351

CONSULTANTS

Ml 1301045424

MN 48411

MO A2009005517
NV 5015

NC 9671

OHIO 9510925

PA RA403281

Rl 2030

SC 8651

TN CERT. No.105438
TEXAS 15417

UT 8470051—-0301
VT 2529

VA 0401008254

WA 11037

N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830

NO.: DATE:

REVISIONS

3104.27.20

100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT

2104.24.20

90% REVIEW

1103.18.20

CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK

NO.: DATE:

SUBMISSIONS &

CLIENT / PROJECT:

Montclair State University

IT'S ALL HERE.

1T HORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | O7043

MSU PROJ. #21C002

PANZER GYM

FLOOR AND BLEACHERS

REFURBISHMENT

MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
T NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
NEW JERSEY 07043

DRAWING TITLE:

EXISTING &

PROPOSED BANK A
PLAN, NOTES, LEGEND,
SCHEDULES &

SECTIONS
oM AS NOTED
DT 02.25.20
oM 7626

THIS DESIGN IS COPYRIGHTED AND
PROTECTED UNDER THE LAWS OF THE
UNITED STATES OF AMERICA. ANY
UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT
WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE
ARCHITECT IS PROHIBITED.

DRAWING NO.

A-02

06/2016

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"



113 =11"
51 ,—6” 44,_0"
[ |
I J. ___________________________________________________________ L ____ —
[ |
] L
[ |
] L
[ |
I L
O i O O B O DI S e e e |
v 11 1 0 .. A T 1 5 1 s 1 A
] ] ] L
BANK B BANK C
Q!I!> 0 4 8’ 16’ 24’
SCALE: 1/8" = 1'=0"
116’=11"
53'—0” AVAILABLE WALL SPACE 46°—0” AVAILABLE WALL SPACE
’ 9 18’_5” ”
11-3" ~—16'-6" TO POWER SUPPLY ~—13'—6” TO POWER SUPPLY 19
1 B 33 i S5 28
(é 1 27 (é A j-_; 1 24 \G
A = — =t
I | I |
=D [DE— D D | ——
3’_3’ C\ 1 27 \C C‘ 1 2% ‘C 3’_955
—1Y20e19+5020 40'—6"— 401948020 36~
Bl IS SN n s B Bl i RS . B
( 2@24 1@20+3@21 8@19+2@20 4@21 2@24 1@24  4@21 6@19+3@R0 4@21 1@24 ﬂ
J NEeelse s asssssssns sl § Nalan e e aesessnns sl \—04
] L ] L
’_ 9 A i_ |” A
']’_O” TYP 16’—6” 16’—6” 16’—6” , Y
'] _O TYP 13’—6” 15’_055 13’—6”
D D 3 O 2 &)
g 44°=0
51'—6
BANK B BANK C

(141 SEATS)

PROPOSED BANK B & C PLAN
0 , ,

¥ g 16 24
SCALE: 1/8" = 1'=0"

(124 SEATS)

’ &n
18 —875

OPEN DIMENSION

2 ROWS @ 2'-9"=5'-6"

4 ROWS @ 2'—2"=8"—

8”

I
O
ov|j‘

1”7 MIN
EARANCE
7 RISERS @ ,
9 5/8"=6'-14" 7 =078
TO TOP OF
SEAT AF.F.
&”
1075" |
" 4,_6”
CLOSED DIMENSION
O 1’_4" 2’—8” 5’_4" 8’—0”

SCALE: 3/8" = 1'=0"

SECTION
0 1-4"2-8 5—4” 8'-0"
— —

SCALE: 3/8" = 1'-0"

SEATING SUMMARY (B)

SIZE QUANTITY
19” 28
20" 8

21" 7

22" 0

23" 0

24" 4
TOTAL: 47

FIRST ROW SCHEDULE

BANK | SECTION MODULE LAYOUT
B 1 PF3
B 2 PF3
B 3 PF3

SAFETY WALK NOTE

(Y)= YELLOW SAFETY STEP
% YELLOW SAFETY WALK DENOTES A

CHANGE IN RISE AND/OR RUN OF
THE AISLE.

¥ ONLY YELLOW SAFETY WALK SHALL
BE USED ON THE FRONT OF THE
STEP THAT HAS BEEN MARKED ON
THE DRAWING IN ADDITION TO THE
BLACK SAFETY WALK STRIPS
SUPPLIED PER STEP, ALL OTHER
NOSES AND STEPS TO HAVE
BLACK SAFETY WALK.

I
HERBS

MUSCIANCG
I

611 MAIN STREET

2ND FLOOR

BOONTON, NJ 07005
TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815
FAX 973—-538-4095

GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP

NJ RA C-8078 Ml 1301045424
NY RA 021687 MN 48411

CA 29549 MO A2009005517
CO 401804 NV 5015

CT 7547 NC 9671

DC ARC6052 OHIO 9510925
DE S5-0008180 PA RA403281

FL ARO014044 Rl 2030

GA RA 012998 SC 8651

IA RA 06841 TN CERT. No.105438
IL RA 001.020501 TEXAS 15417

IN AR11300067 UT 8470051—-0301

KS 5073 VT 2529

LA 5690 VA 0401008254

MD 11039 WA 11037

MA 10131 N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830

NJ PLANNER 4351

CONSULTANTS

REVISIONS

NO.: DATE:

SEATING SUMMARY (C)

3

04.27.20

100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT

2

04.24.20

90% REVIEW

1

03.18.20

CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK

NO.:

DATE:

SIZE QUANTITY
19” 20
20" 11
21" 8
22" 0
23" 0
24" 2
TOTAL: 41
FIRST ROW SCHEDULE

BANK | SECTION MODULE LAYOUT

C 1 PF3
C 2 PF3
C S PF3

SUBMISSIONS &

CLIENT / PROJECT:

Montclair State University

1T HORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | O7043

MSU PROJ. #21C002

PANZER GYM

FLOOR AND BLEACHERS
REFURBISHMENT

MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
T NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
NEW JERSEY 07043

DRAWING TITLE:

PROPOSED BANK B &
C PLANS, SECTIONS,
SCHEDULES &

NOTES

oM AS NOTED
DT 02.25.20
oM 7626

THIS DESIGN IS COPYRIGHTED AND
PROTECTED UNDER THE LAWS OF THE
UNITED STATES OF AMERICA. ANY
UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT

DRAWING NO.

A-03

06/2016

WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE
ARCHITECT IS PROHIBITED.

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"




OF A 4" SPHERE

SCALE: 3/4" = 1'-0"

/ N <\;
N
T
"d_
ﬁ‘\;
[ =
MAXAM PLUS
9 5/8” RISE
RH SHOWN
LH OPPOSITE
0 8" 1'—-4" 2'-8”" 4'-Q"
SCALE: 3/4" = 1'-0"
RS
2” WIDE ADHESIVE STRIP OF __1/2 RS
CONTRASTING COLOR, NON-—SKID
SURFACE (3 PER STEP @ 1" — NOSE COVER
MAX FROM LEAD EDGE)
% a2 —~
Q -
[[eoooo o]
RS = ROW SPACING
R = RISE
MAXAM 26
O 8” 11_4” 2’—8" 4’—0"

/ N
i
T
pe
[ =
MAXAM PLUS
9 5/8” RISE
RH SHOWN
LH OPPOSITE
DETAIL
0 8" 1'-4" 2'-8" 4'-0"
m

TO PROHIBIT THE PASSAGE
OF A 4” SPHERE

SCALE: 3/4" = 1'-0"

DlM "B"

DlM ”A”

ROW SPACE

qmooo
Sul
9
-

il
MXM26 /9.625R
ROV\/ SPACE D|M ”A” D|M ”B”
22" 2’—11 1/8" | 2=3 7/8"
24” 2’—10 5/8” | 2=7 7/8"
26" 2'—10 1/16” | 2’—=11 7/8"
DETAIL
0o 8 1-4" 2’8" 40"
m

SCALE: 3/4" = 1'-0"

RS NON—SKID SURFACE (1 PER
2” WIDE ADHESIVE STRIP OF -—1/2 RS — STEP @ 1”7 MAX FROM LEAD
CONTRASTING COLOR, NON—SKID EDGE)
SURFACE (2 PER STEP @ 1" MAX——————_
FROM LEAD EDGE)
r x ™
N -]
== 5]
RS = ROW SPACING
R = RISE
MAXAM 26
DETAIL
0 8" 1—4" 2'—-8” 4 —-Q”
m
SCALE: 3/4” = 1’'=0"
DIM "B”
<
=
ROW SPACE
<$wo ‘ o]
g
.
MXMPLUS/9625R
ROW SPACE D”\/I ”A” D|M ))B”
307 2'—10 3/4” 21{515/15’
327 2'—10 5/HY 214315/Hf
33" 214C)1/8" 2'—11 15/16"
DETAIL
0 8" 1—4" 2'-8" 4'-0"
m

2" WIDE ADHESIVE STRIP OF
CONTRASTING COLOR,

I
HERBS

MUSCIANCG
I

LLC

611 MAIN STREET
2ND FLOOR
BOONTON, NJ 07005

TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815

FAX 973—-538-4095

GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP

NJ RA C-8078
NY RA 021687
CA 29549

CO 401804

CT 7547

DC ARC6052

DE S5-0008180
FL ARO014044
GA RA 012998
IA RA 06841

IL RA 001.020501
IN AR11300067
KS 5073

LA 5690

MD 11039

MA 10131

NJ PLANNER 4351

CONSULTANTS

Ml 1301045424

MN 48411

MO A2009005517
NV 5015

NC 9671

OHIO 9510925

PA RA403281

Rl 2030

SC 8651

TN CERT. No.105438
TEXAS 15417

UT 8470051—-0301
VT 2529

VA 0401008254

WA 11037

N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830

SCALE: 3/4" = 1'-0"

REVISIONS

NO.: DATE:

3104.27.20| 100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT
2104.24.20| 90% REVIEW
1103.18.20 | CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK

NO.: DATE:

SUBMISSIONS &

CLIENT / PROJECT:

Montclair State University

IT'S ALL HERE.

1T HORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | O7043

MSU PROJ. #21C002

PANZER GYM

FLOOR AND BLEACHERS
REFURBISHMENT

MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
T NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
NEW JERSEY 07043

DRAWING TITLE:

DETAILS

oM AS NOTED
. |

DT 02.25.20

oM 7626

THIS DESIGN IS COPYRIGHTED AND DRAWING NO.
PROTECTED UNDER THE LAWS OF THE
UNITED STATES OF AMERICA. ANY

UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT
WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE
ARCHITECT IS PROHIBITED. -—

06/2016

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"




Wood or Aluminum Trim e
Optional Furring Strip by GC (optional) 1 S
Strip by others Citti ; 7
ptional Furring _ M‘U’S_C_ A\ FI( j
Strip by others —L;
716" Waterboard 1T..
Backer = )
2
o LLC
; / \ ‘( 611 MAIN STREET
2" Foam Filler 5 | 2ND FLOOR
\% L[/ & BOONTON, NJ 07005
i i TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815
//A’ 60 FAX 973-538-4095
¥
aantomes oz ! GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP
AR NJ RA C-8078 MI 1301045424
NY RA 021687 MN 48411
% | CA 29549 MO A2009005517
1" or 7547 NC 9671
v A DC ARC6052 OHIO 9510925
L Pad L DE S5—0008180 PA RA403281
Do Not Scale . FL AROD14044 Rl 2030
C Pad ‘ T & iy GA RA 012998 SC 8651
Standard Pad o IA RA 06841 TN CERT. No.105438
ﬁ2227/ >4 IL RA 001.020501 TEXAS 15417
5 sl A / D IN AR11300067 UT 8470051-0301
KS 5073 VT 2529
| Mgl racs : Wal! Pads _ L \( ‘ A/ LA 5690 VA 0401008254
sometric Mounting Detall Mounting Detail MD 11039 WA 11037
~ hannel System MA 10131 N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830
NJ PLANNER 4351
EXISTING WALL PADDING MASONRY / .
ANCHOR Qptional Z-Clip
Attachment A B
GENERAL NOTES: |
1. COORDINATE WITH OWNER/ARCHITECT ON FINAL COLOR i T
SELECTION FOR WALL PADDING DURING MOCKUP. ) | e .
2.  PANELS SHALL CONSIST OF (2”) THICK POLYURETHANE - : L]
FOAM BONDED TO A 7 /16" THICK WAFERBOARD BACKER AND
COVERED WITH A 14 OZ. VINYL COVERING. VINYL COVER SHALL F W
BE COATED POLYESTER FABRIC WITH LEATHER GRAIN WJ L d ||
3. VINYL TO HAVE AVERAGE WEIGHT OF 14 0OZ. PER SQUARE PADDING NO:  DATE:

YARD, BREAKING STRENGTH OF 350 PSI, TEAR RESISTANCE OF
65 POUNDS AND BE RATED AS SELF EXTINGUISHING. VINYL TO
BE RESISTANT TO ROT, MILDEW, FUNGUS AND ULTRAVIOLET ‘ 20'—4" ‘

_ 5.19.2020 REVISION

- 2 !

MM TIELATNR SUTATIE %

a5
|

)

AN

LIGHT. PANEL FRONT AND EDGES SHALL BE VINYL WRAPPED |
AND SECURELY STAPLED TO THE WOOD BACKER SO THAT
BACKER IS NOT EXPOSED ON FRONT OR 4 SIDES.

4. INSTALLATION ON EXISTING CMU WALL, REFER TO 1
MANUFACTURER INSTRUCTIONS.

5. DRAPER "ECOVISION WALL PADS CLASS A” OR EQUAL TO.

37

[a &) m <

28
28

SEATS

Il Il
| A A | !

fe]

@PARTIAL FLOOR PLAN
0] 4’ 8’ 16’ 24’

SCALE: 1/8" = 1'-0"

/7

3104.27.20| 100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT
2104.24.20| 90% REVIEW
1103.18.20 | CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK

i \\ CLIENT / PROJECT:
O l

MontclalrState
b —r 1

1 NORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | D7TR42

. MSU PROJ. #21C002
i JRAVANSEHIIVRTSIEANIOIN

SUBMISSIONS &

BANK C

5 SEATS

D
I______C_______________

PANZER GYM

FLOOR AND BLEACHERS
REFURBISHMENT

o MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
T NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
NEW JERSEY 07043

’76 DRAWING TITLE:
WALL PADDING
PLANS & NOTES

W PROJECT MANAGER: SCALE:

GM AS NOTED

DRAWN BY: DATE:

1 DT 02.25.20
$ CHECKED BY: PROJECT NO.:
GM 7626
PROTECTED UNDER THE LAWS OF THE o

PARTIAL FLOOR PLAN
0 4 g8’ 16’ 24’ UNTED STATES OF AMERIGA ANY

UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT
NORTH m WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE A O 5
ARCHITECT IS PROHIBITED. -
SCALE: 1/8" = 1'=0"

06/2016

=
L
1

44

ol ) s ) o

S | S ) -

OWZ
=
3
4

8" 10’_1”

1]

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"




A D—D—1F

e | [ |
| [/ - A\ |II & é é é [ [ - \ [
- = S ) E—— N
|

\—cn= =

N
N\
N\

s
/
/

\"_\\\\\\
\2 H _ 8 33,

2’11

NN

NN\

AE

LEVA
>

TION

4

87

N
I
0]

— ——

SCALE: 1/4" = 1"-0"

NN

2'—0" TYP.

=z
=
=
<

P
<

L WALL PADS

1
-

D—1—Lr

| 1

IE

k)
=

o - / s VN
e . | .
B ELEVATION e was s ; ; ‘

SCALE: 1/4" = 1"=0"

HERBS

MUSCIANCG
I

611 MAIN STREET

2ND FLOOR

BOONTON, NJ 07005
TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815
FAX 973—-538-4095

GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP

NJ RA C-8078 Ml 1301045424

NY RA 021687 MN 48411

CA 29549 MO A2009005517
CO 401804 NV 5015

CT 7547 NC 9671

DC ARC6052 OHIO 9510925

DE S5-0008180 PA RA403281

FL ARO014044 Rl 2030

GA RA 012998 SC 8651

IA RA 06841 TN CERT. No.105438

IL RA 001.020501
IN AR11300067

TEXAS 15417
UT 8470051—-0301

KS 5073 VT 2529

LA 5690 VA 0401008254

MD 11039 WA 11037

MA 10131 N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830

NJ PLANNER 4351

CONSULTANTS

REVISIONS

NO.: DATE:

3104.27.20| 100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT
2104.24.20| 90% REVIEW
1103.18.20 | CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK

NO.: DATE:

SUBMISSIONS &

CLIENT / PROJECT:

Montclair State University

1T HORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | O7043

MSU PROJ. #21C002

PANZER GYM

FLOOR AND BLEACHERS
REFURBISHMENT

MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
T NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
NEW JERSEY 07043

DRAWING TITLE:

WALL PADDING
ELEVATIONS

oM AS NOTED
. |

DT 02.25.20

oM 7626

THIS DESIGN IS COPYRIGHTED AND
PROTECTED UNDER THE LAWS OF THE

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA. ANY

UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT

WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE

ARCHITECT IS PROHIBITED. -—

06/2016

DRAWING NO.

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"




EXISTING WALL GRILLES

Submittal Sheet

320 SERIES GRILLES & REGISTERS

D=NOMINAL DUCT SIZE

— OPTIONAL VCS3

1 3/8° (35)

DAMPER

A A AT

DIBIBIGIO

/4" (6)

STTSTTTTTTLNeTeceeeYYy

BIBIBIGIO

CORE STYLE O A SCREW

FASTENING

—*l I‘— 1/2" (13)

e OPENING=NOMINAL—13/16" (20) — =

. MULLION=NOMINAL-5/16" (8) — =
OVERALL=NOMINAL+1 11/16" (43}

N
N
:(_
i

[ D MOUNTING
FRAME

O 920 FRONT BLADES

1/2"(13)

MATERIAL:

e HEAVY DUTY STEEL CONSTRUCTION

* 16 GAUGE STEEL FRAME

* 14 GAUGE STEEL FRONT DEFLECTION BLADES
SPACED AT 1/2" (13)

e STEEL REAR DEFLECTION BLADES
SPACED AT 3/4" (19)

* 14 GAUGE STEEL MULLIONS

o OPTIONAL D MOUNTING FRAME
—EXTRUDED ALUMINUM

OPTIONS:

O VCS3—C/W. COATED STEEL OPPOSED

BLADE DAMPER
O ¢/W. O DEGREE BLADE LOCK
O C/W. 45 DEGREE BLADE LOCK

FINISH:

O B12 WHITE
{(OPTIONAL FINISHES AVAILABLE}

]

t— NOM. DUCT + 3/16"(5)

NOM. DUCT + 1/47(6)

NOTES:

s [NDIVIDUALLY ADJUSTABLE FRONT BLADES (45 TO —45 DEG.)

« ONE BLADE FIXED AT O DEFLECTION APPROXIMATELY
EVERY 12° (305)
» INDMDUALLY ADJUSTABLE REAR BLADES

* TYPE A FASTENING — COUNTERSUNK
SCREW HOLES FOR NO.8 S.M.S. PER
FACTORY STANDARD. (SCREWS SUPPLIED)

s AVAILABLE SIZES — MIN.= 6"x4” (152x101)
MAX. ONE PIECE 48"x48" (1219x1219)

s OVERSIZED UNITS AVAILABLE ¢/w DUCT
MOUNTING CHANNEL.

* BLADE CRIENTATION — FRONT SET
— L = PARALLEL TO LONG DIMENSION.

— 5 = PARALLEL TO SHORT DIMENSION.

ALL METRIC DIMENSIONS ( ) ARE SOFT CONVERTED. IMPERIAL DIMENSIONS ARE CONVERTED TO METRIC AND ROUNDED TO THE NEAREST MILLIMETER.

NOM. SIZE + 2 1/2°(64)
-— NOM. SIZE — 13/167(21)
- - 1 1/47(32)

/ \

// 3 7] |

/ |:| 5 |
AN

N\
N\

ENERAL NOTES

THE 14 GAUGE STEEL BORDER SHALL HAVE SMOOTH CONTOURS TO REDUCE THE POSSIBILITY OF
INJURY TO OCCUPANTS WHEN INSTALLED IN A GYMNASIUM. THE GRILLE SHALL BE
SUITABLE FOR SURFACE MOUNTING WITH 1—1/4 INCH FLAT BORDER.
GRILLES BLADES SHALL BE SINGLE DEFLECTION, INDIVIDUALLY ADJUSTABLE LOUVER TYPE.
THE FRONT BLADES SHALL BE ADJUSTABLE FROM +/— 45 DEGREES DEGREES DEFLECTION, WITH
1/2 INCH ON CENTER BLADE SPACING.
THE REAR BLADES SHALL BE INDIVIDUAL ADJUSTABLE WITH 3/4 INCH ON CENTER BLADE SPACING.
THE GRILLE BLADE ORIENTATION SHALL BE (SELECT ONE), AS INDICATED ON THE OUTLET
SCHEDULE.

a. FRONT BLADES PARALLEL TO THE LONG DIMENSION.

b. FRONT BLADES PARALLEL TO THE SHORT DIMENSION.
THE FRAME SHALL BE 16 GAUGE COLD ROLLED STEEL CONSTRUCTION, AND THE FRONT DEFLECTION
BLADES AND MULLIONS SHALL BE 14 GAUGE COLD ROLLED STEEL CONSTRUCTION.
THE REAR DEFLECTION BLADES SHALL BE 24 GAUGE COLD ROLLED STEEL.
REMOVE ALL WALL GRILLES AND INSTALL NEW GRILLES IN SAME LOCATION. 4" A.F.F.

L

—
=

O\LZ
- d]

£e

(A -
40

(5) METAL GRILLES TO BE
REPLACED; APPROXL 20" X 40"

Y

RIARI;

——

K C

24

| owz
Y

Em ® |

8¢

ELEVATION
0 2'-8" 5-4 10'-8" 16'~0"
— | —

SCALE: 3/16” = 1'-0"

BLEACHER’S OUTLINE

1"—8"

NEW WALL GRILLES

N\

PARTIAL FLOOR PLAN

\
0 VA ¥ 16’ 24’

NORTH

SCALE: 1/8" = 1"-0"

I
HERBS

MUSCIANO
I

611 MAIN STREET

2ND FLOOR

BOONTON, NJ 07005
TELEPHONE (973) 538-3815
FAX 973-538-4095

GARY MUSCIANO, RA, PP

NJ RA C-8078 Ml 1301045424
NY RA 021687 MN 48411

CA 29549 MO A2009005517
CO 401804 NV 5015

CT 7547 NC 9671

DC ARC6052 OHIO 9510925

DE S5-0008180 PA RA403281

FL ARO014044 Rl 2030

GA RA 012998 SC 8651

IA RA 06841 TN CERT. No.105438
IL RA 001.020501 TEXAS 15417

IN AR11300067 UT 8470051—-0301
KS 5073 VT 2529

LA 5690 VA 0401008254
MD 11039 WA 11037

MA 10131 N.J. CERT. of AUTH. No. AC-830
NJ PLANNER 4351

CONSULTANTS

L LL AT
-

REVISIONS

NO.: DATE:

>

5.19.2020 REVISION

3104.27.20| 100% REVIEW FOR PERMIT
2104.24.20| 90% REVIEW
1103.18.20 | CHANGED SCOPE OF WORK

NO.: DATE:

SUBMISSIONS &

CLIENT / PROJECT:

Montclair State University

1 NORMAL AVE | MONTCLAIR, NEW JERSEY | D7TR42

MSU PROJ. #21C002

PANZER GYM

FLOOR AND BLEACHERS
REFURBISHMENT

MONTCLAIR STATE UNIVERSITY
T NORMAL AVENUE MONTCLAIR,
NEW JERSEY 07043

DRAWING TITLE:

WALL GRILLES
DETAILS,
ELEVATIONS &
NOTES

oM AS NOTED
DT 02.25.20
oM 7626

THIS DESIGN IS COPYRIGHTED AND DRAWING NO.
PROTECTED UNDER THE LAWS OF THE

UNITED STATES OF AMERICA. ANY

UNAUTHORIZED USE OF THE DOCUMENT

WITHOUT WRITTEN CONSENT OF THE

ARCHITECT IS PRQOHIBITED. -—

06/2016

THIS TITLEBLOCK FORMATED FOR PLOTTING FULL
SIZE AT 22" X 34", HALF SIZE AT 11" X 17"




	7626_Addendum_05.20.2020
	ADDENDUM  01
	Item ADD-1-1:
	References to Add Alternates are removed.
	References to Add Alternates are removed.
	References to Add Alternates are removed.
	References to Add Alternates are removed.

	Item ADD-1-5:
	References to Add Alternates are removed.

	END OF ADDENDUM 01

	7626_SET_5.20.20_ADD1
	T-01
	D-01
	A-01
	A-02
	A-03
	A-04
	A-05
	A-06
	A-07




